PAGE: 1

DATE: 09/14/10

CONTRACT IR-30155-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0400410 DESCRIPTION: ROAD RECONSTRUCTION ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 22,800,000.00 (A + B)

CALL: 151 ROUTE: 465 GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON I-465 INTERCHANGE AT KEYSTONE AVENUE

CODE	COUNTY: MARION BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE L	OW REMARKS
35-0175870	BERNS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY INC	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-545-8714	\$ 18,928,878.86 	R	 A + B = \$ 18,928,878.86
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	GOSHEN Indiana	574-875-5183	\$ 18,266,709.43 	R :	X AWARD DBE 5.97% * A + B = \$ 18,366,709.43
35-1698047	GRADEX INC	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-573-3970	\$ 18,098,932.96 	R	 A + B = \$ 18,406,932.96
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP 	COLUMBUS Indiana	800-854-1830	\$ 18,995,000.00 	R	 A + B = \$ 19,193,000.00

^{*} LOW BID DETERMINED BY THE TOTAL SUM OF SECTIONS A AND B COMBINED.

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

PAGE: 2 OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED DATE: 09/14/10 FOR THE LETTING OF September 01, 2010

CONTRACT IR-31104-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0200699 DBE GOAL: 4.00 ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 44,040,000.00 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE WIDENING

CALL: 171 ROUTE: 70 GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON I-70 FROM 0.6 MILE EAST OF POST ROAD TO 1.3 MILES EAST

OF MOUNT COMFORT ROAD COUNTY: HANCOCK

CODE	COUNTY: HANCOCK BIDDER	MARION ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE LOW	REMARKS
	PRESENT VALUE COST, HMA PAVEMENT			\$ 5,094,040.59 		
	PRESENT VALUE COST, PCCP PAVEMENT			\$ 3,539,454.84 		
	TOTAL OF FIXED PRICE ITEMS SECTION 0003 CONSTRUCTION			22,677.00 		
31-1023518	KOKOSING CONSTRUCTION CO INC HMA OPTION	COLUMBUS Ohio	614-228-1029	NO BID 		
31-1023518	KOKOSING CONSTRUCTION CO INC PCCP OPTION	COLUMBUS Ohio	614-228-1029	\$ 38,708,192.73 	R	
31-1257382	HI WAY PAVING INC	HILLIARD Ohio	614-876-1700	NO BID		
31-1257382	HI WAY PAVING INC PCCP OPTION	HILLIARD Ohio	614-876-1700	\$ 36,335,804.34 	R	
35-0175870	BERNS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY INC HMA OPTION	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-545-8714	NO BID		
35-0175870	BERNS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY INC PCCP OPTION	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-545-8714	\$ 33,846,852.49 	R	
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION HMA OPTION	GOSHEN Indiana	574-875-5183	\$ 33,596,108.42 	R	
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION PCCP OPTION	GOSHEN Indiana	574-875-5183	\$ 32,332,908.93 	R X	AWARD PENDING * DBE 4.08%
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP HMA OPTION	COLUMBUS Indiana	800-854-1830	\$ 36,694,492.07 	R	
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP PCCP OPTION	COLUMBUS Indiana	800-854-1830	NO BID		

CONTRACT IR-31104-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0200699 DBE GOAL: 4.00 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE WIDENING ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 44,040,000.00 CALL: 171 ROUTE: 70 GREENFIELD DISTRICT (CONTINUED) LOCATION: ON I-70 FROM 0.6 MILE EAST OF POST ROAD TO 1.3 MILES EAST OF MOUNT COMFORT ROAD COUNTY: HANCOCK MARION BIDDER ADDRESS PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS ______ 99-9996209 | WALSH CONSTRUCTION CO/E & B PA | LAPORTE | HMA OPTION | Indiana 219-324-4320 | NO BID ______ 99-9996209 | WALSH CONSTRUCTION CO/E & B PA | LAPORTE | \$ 37,974,271.64 |R |

NOTE: THE RANK OF THE BIDDERS IS DETERMINED FROM THE SUM OF A SECTION PLUS THE APPROPRIATE PRESENT VALUE COST (NOT INCLUDING SECTION 0003). A BID TOTAL IS THE SUM OF SECTION 0001 OR 0002 PLUS SECTION 0003.

(AMOUNTS OF CONTRACTORS' BIDS SHOWN INCLUDE SECTION 0003.)

PCCP OPTION Indiana 219-324-4320

PAGE: 2

DATE: 09/14/10

^{*}ADDITIONAL TIME IS REQUIRED TO SECURE FHWA AWARD CONCURRENCE.

PAGE: 3

DATE: 09/14/10

CONTRACT IR-31108-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. S870011

DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD CONSTRUCTION

DESCRIPTION: NEW ROAD CONSTRUCTION

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 12,468,000.00

CALL: 181 ROUTE: 331 LAPORTE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 331 FROM US 20 BYPASS, SOUTH OF 12 STREET

CODE	COUNTY: ST. JOSEPH BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE LO	DW REMARKS
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	GOSHEN Indiana	574-875-5183	\$ 10,078,908.82 	R	
35-0997978	PHEND & BROWN INC	MILFORD Indiana	574-658-4166	\$ 11,985,600.50 	R	
35-1058916	WOODRUFF & SONS INC	MICHIGAN CITY Indiana	219-872-8605	\$ 13,013,617.36 	R	
35-1068009	DYER CONSTRUCTION CO	DYER Indiana	219-865-2961	\$ 11,387,031.86 	R	
35-1120685	WALSH & KELLY INC	GRIFFITH Indiana	219-924-5900	\$ 10,246,308.45 	R	
35-1185040	NIBLOCK EXCAVATING INC	BRISTOL Indiana	574-848-4437	\$ 12,755,587.20 	R	
35-1489621	HRP CONSTRUCTION INC	SOUTH BEND Indiana	574-271-7800	\$ 13,544,850.56 	R	
38-1625197	SELGE CONSTRUCTION CO INC	NILES Michigan	269-684-0842	\$ 9,695,468.73 	R X	AWARD PENDING * DBE 5.01%
38-2051611	HOFFMAN BROTHERS INC	BATTLE CREEK Michigan	269-965-1207	\$ 10,494,891.07 	R	

^{*}ADDITIONAL TIME IS REQUIRED FOR BID REVIEW BY DISTRICT OR LPA.

PAGE: 4 DATE: 09/14/10

CONTRACT IR-32744-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0901664 DESCRIPTION: ENVIRONMENTAL MITIGATION ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 2,521,950.00

CALL: 185 ROUTE: 25 CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ALONG SR 25 IN PROPHETSTOWN STATE PARK

CODE	COUNTY: TIPPECANOE BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE		AMOUNT OF BID	TYPI	E LOW	REMARKS
31-1323837	SUNESIS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY 	WEST CHESTER Ohio	513-326-6000	\$ 	2,880,243.56	R 		
35-1386990	JACK ISOM CONSTRUCTION CO	REYNOLDS Indiana	219-984-5765	\$ 	2,936,136.50	R 		
35-1415044	F & K CONSTRUCTION INC	FLORA Indiana	574-967-4543	\$ 	2,633,709.13	R 		
35-1636776	LINKEL COMPANY 	BATESVILLE Indiana	812-934-5190	\$ 	1,934,923.40	C	X	AWARD DBE 5.52%
35-1801998	CLR INC	VINCENNES Indiana	812-886-0360	\$ 	2,888,601.00	R 		
38-3806996	HIS CONSTRUCTORS INC	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-284-1195	 \$ 	2,689,622.00	R		

PAGE: 5

DATE: 09/14/10

CONTRACT IR-33103-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1000047

DESCRIPTION: ENVIRONMENTAL MITIGATION

DESCRIPTION: ENVIRONMENTAL MITIGATION

DESCRIPTION: ENVIRONMENTAL MITIGATION

DESCRIPTION: \$ 632,000.00

CALL: 191 ROUTE: 465 GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LARWILL

LOCATION: AT PLEASANT RUN GOLF COURSE

35-1841857 | CRI CONSTRUCTION INC

38-3806996 | HIS CONSTRUCTORS INC

COUNTY: MARION

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	A	MOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
31-1323837	SUNESIS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY	WEST CHESTER Ohio	513-326-6000	\$ 	759,309.11	R 	X	AWARD *
35-1582525	JERRY AIGNER CONSTRUCTION	BOONVILLE Indiana	812-897-5815	\$	924,542.00	R 		
35-1636776	LINKEL COMPANY 	BATESVILLE Indiana	812-934-5190	\$	888,474.50	R 		
35-1801998	CLR INC	VINCENNES Indiana	812-886-0360	 \$ 	829,877.86	R 		

Indiana 260-327-3300

| Indiana | 317-284-1195 |

| \$ 1,077,029.00 |R |

*AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN \$1,000,000.00.

PAGE: 6 DATE: 09/14/10

CONTRACT R -29509-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 9069001 DESCRIPTION: ROAD REHABILITATION ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 1,778,500.00

CALL: 221 ROUTE: SEYMOUR DISTRICT LOCATION: ON EASTERN AVENUE FROM SR 101 TO SUNMAN CITY LIMITS

COUNTY: RIPLEY

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
31-1323837	SUNESIS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY 	WEST CHESTER Ohio	513-326-6000	\$ 1,585,526.00 R
35-0844079	PAUL H ROHE COMPANY 	AURORA Indiana	812-926-1471	\$ 1,500,554.57 R
35-1128289	BEATY CONSTRUCTION INC	BOGGSTOWN Indiana	317-835-2254	\$ 1,457,325.68 R
35-1357381	DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC	NORTH VERNON Indiana	812-346-4135	\$ 1,639,700.74 R
35-1636776	LINKEL COMPANY 	BATESVILLE Indiana	812-934-5190	\$ 1,662,558.30 R
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP 	COLUMBUS Indiana	800-854-1830	\$ 1,394,969.40 R X AWARD DBE 5.02%

PAGE: 7

DATE: 09/14/10

CONTRACT R -32188-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0401069 DESCRIPTION: ENHANCEMENT, BIKE AND PEDESTRIAN FACILITIES ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 1,505,000.00

CALL: 231 ROUTE: SEYMOUR DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON INDIAN CREEK TRAIL

COUNTY: HARRISON

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE LOW	REMARKS
35-1487672	MAC CONSTRUCTION & EXCAVATING 	NEW ALBANY Indiana	812-941-7895	\$ 1,696,000.00 	R	
35-1618530	AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE	JEFFERSONVILLE Indiana	812-280-4404	\$ 1,692,904.41 	R	
35-2040801	GOHMANN ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION	CLARKSVILLE Indiana	812-282-1349	\$ 1,416,000.00	R X	AWARD DBE 7.36%

PAGE: 8 DATE: 09/14/10

CONTRACT R -32387-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0900111 DESCRIPTION: NEW CABLE BARRIER SYSTEM ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 1,222,900.00

CALL: 241 ROUTE: 69 GREENFIELD DISTRICT LOCATION: ON I-69 AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS

COUNTRY - DELAMADE

04-3815584 GFS FENCE GUARDRAIL & SIGNAGE HUNTLEY 111inois 224-654-2122 \$ 1,141,636.35 R	CODE	COUNTY: DELAWARE BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE		AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
Indiana 317-876-3739	04-3815584	GFS FENCE GUARDRAIL & SIGNAGE 		224-654-2122	\$ 	1,141,636.35	R 		
Indiana 317-835-2745	35-0821499	JAMES H DREW CORPORATION		317-876-3739	\$ 	1,112,191.00	R 		
Indiana 317-594-0291	35-1643252	C-TECH CORPORATION INC		317-835-2745	\$ 	913,292.90	R 		
Michigan 616-877-0020	35-2110733	SPECIALTIES COMPANY LLC			\$ 	948,513.00	R 		
Michigan 810-695-7516	38-1955046	SLAGTER GROUP OF COMPANIES		616-877-0020	\$ 	876,650.00	R 		IRREGULAR *
Michigan 586-749-6900	38-2421492	ACTION TRAFFIC MAINTENANCE		810-695-7516	\$ 	997,827.25	R 		
Michigan 586-755-0900	38-2932367	RMD HOLDINGS LTD		586-749-6900	\$ 	861,247.88	R 	 	
	38-2954313	FUTURE FENCE COMPANY		586-755-0900	\$ 	848,937.00	R 	X	AWARD
	43-1012298	COLLINS & HERMANN INC		314-869-8000	\$ 	1,050,050.50	R 		

^{*}BIDDER FAILED TO SUBMIT A DRUG TESTING PLAN.

PAGE: 9 DATE: 09/14/10

CONTRACT R -32388-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0900112 DESCRIPTION: GUARDRAIL INSTALLATION ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 1,985,000.00

CALL: 251 ROUTE: I-70 GREENFIELD DISTRICT LOCATION: AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS ALONG I-70

CODE	COUNTY: VARIOUS BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE		AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
04-3815584	GFS FENCE GUARDRAIL & SIGNAGE	HUNTLEY Illinois	224-654-2122	\$ 	1,869,586.56	R 	 	
35-0821499	JAMES H DREW CORPORATION	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-876-3739	\$ 	1,826,838.00	R 	 	
35-1487672	MAC CONSTRUCTION & EXCAVATING	NEW ALBANY Indiana	812-941-7895	\$ 	1,719,327.50	R 	 	
35-1643252	C-TECH CORPORATION INC	BOGGSTOWN Indiana	317-835-2745	\$ 	1,593,791.62	R 	 	
35-2110733	SPECIALTIES COMPANY LLC	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-594-0291	\$ 	1,846,276.00	R 	 	
38-2932367	RMD HOLDINGS LTD	CHESTERFIELD Michigan	586-749-6900	\$ 	1,439,886.94	R 	X 	AWARD
38-2954313	FUTURE FENCE COMPANY	WARREN Michigan	586-755-0900	\$ 	1,264,525.00	R	 	REJECTED *
43-1012298	COLLINS & HERMANN INC 	ST LOUIS Missouri	314-869-8000	\$ 	1,670,670.70	R 	 	

^{*}EXCEEDED ITS BIDDING CAPACITY. BID REJECTED PURSUANT TO 105 IAC 11-3-16(A)(2)(B).

PAGE: 10 DATE: 09/14/10

CONTRACT R -32735-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0400311 DESCRIPTION: SIGHT DISTANCE IMPROVEMENT ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 1,330,000.00

CALL: 261 ROUTE: CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT LOCATION: ON TYLER ROAD FROM CR 900N TO NORTH COUNTY LINE ROAD

COUNTY: TIPPECANOE

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE LOW	REMARKS
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	GOSHEN Indiana	574-875-5183	\$ 1,250,103.00	R X 	AWARD DBE 6.82%
35-1386990	JACK ISOM CONSTRUCTION CO	REYNOLDS Indiana	219-984-5765	\$ 1,327,784.39	R 	
35-1875662	CRIDER & CRIDER INC 	BLOOMINGTON Indiana	812-336-4452	\$ 1,367,596.36	R	
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP 	COLUMBUS Indiana	800-854-1830	\$ 1,293,214.52	R	

PAGE: 11

DATE: 09/14/10

CONTRACT R -33107-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0902244 DBE GOAL: 0.00 DESCRIPTION: SIDEWALK RECONSTRUCTION ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 427,000.00 CALL: 271 FT. WAYNE DISTRICT ROUTE: LOCATION: ALONG CANAL STREET FROM MIAMI STREET TO WABASH STREET IN CITY OF WABASH COUNTY: WABASH BIDDER PHONE AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW ADDRESS REMARKS MILFORD | \$ 476,324.10 |R 35-0997978 | PHEND & BROWN INC Indiana 574-658-4166 | \$ 575,967.00 |R | 35-1065659 | BROOKS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY IN | FORT WAYNE Indiana 260-478-1990 | \$ 355,128.75 |R | X | 35-1139301 | E & B PAVING INC ANDERSON AWARD 765-643-5358 35-1505753 | GAUNT & SON ASPHALT INC WABASH | \$ 534,530.50 | R 260-563-1821 Indiana

| Indiana 260-327-3300 | | | |

260-627-5981

| \$ 512,223.81 |R

| \$ 457,279.50 |R |

LEO

Indiana

LARWILL

35-1817530 | PIONEER ASSOCIATES INC

35-1841857 | CRI CONSTRUCTION INC

PAGE: 12 DATE: 09/14/10

CONTRACT RS-33265-B FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1005599 DESCRIPTION: ASPHALT RESURFACE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 1,660,000.00

CALL: 287 ROUTE: 65 CRAWFORDSVILLE DISTRICT LOCATION: ON I-65 FROM 4.47 MILES SOUTH OF US 231 TO US 231

INTERCHANGE

COUNTY: WHITE

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	GOSHEN Indiana	574-875-5183	\$ 1,799,702.52 R
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP 	COLUMBUS Indiana	800-854-1830	\$ 1,697,913.30 R X AWARD * DBE 3.32%

^{*}AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(C) - LOW BIDDER IS WITHIN 15% OF THE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE.

PAGE: 13 DATE: 09/14/10

CONTRACT B -28879-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 4572003 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REPLACEMENT ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 753,000.00

CALL: 331 ROUTE: SR 203 SEYMOUR DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 203 OVER TOWN CREEK, 0.44 MILE NORTH OF SR 356

CODE	COUNTY: SCOTT BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	А	MOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1310611	DUNCAN ROBERTSON INC	FRANKLIN Indiana	317-736-6024	 \$ 	648,206.93	R 	X	AWARD DBE 6.22%
35-1357381	DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC	NORTH VERNON Indiana	812-346-4135	 \$ 	694,396.90	R 		
35-1385672	FORCE CONSTRUCTION CO INC	COLUMBUS Indiana	812-372-8441	 \$ 	855,404.65	R 		
35-1487672	MAC CONSTRUCTION & EXCAVATING	NEW ALBANY Indiana	812-941-7895	 \$ 	784,036.75	R 		
35-1549010	MCALISTER EXCAVATING CO INC	PATRIOT Indiana	812-594-2402	 \$ 	703,626.63	R 		
35-1618530	AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE	JEFFERSONVILLE Indiana	812-280-4404	 \$ 	837,516.50	R 		
35-2040801	GOHMANN ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION	CLARKSVILLE Indiana	812-282-1349	 \$ 	692,000.00	R 		

PAGE: 14

DATE: 09/14/10

CONTRACT B -29973-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0300106 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REPLACEMENT ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ NONE BELOW

CALL: 341 ROUTE: 166 VINCENNES DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON SR 166 OVER MILLSTONE CREEK, 1.94 MILES SOUTH OF SR 66

COUNTY: PERRY

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID TYPE LOW REMARKS
35-1618530	AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE	JEFFERSONVILLE Indiana	812-280-4404	\$ 1,915,930.60 R REJECTED *
35-1878024	RAGLE INC 	NEWBURGH Indiana	812-853-9558	\$ 1,571,930.63 R X REJECTED *
35-2040801	GOHMANN ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION	CLARKSVILLE Indiana	812-282-1349	\$ 1,598,000.00 R REJECTED *

^{*} NO BIDS BELOW THE ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE - ALL BIDS REJECTED; TO BE READVERTISED.

PAGE: 15 DATE: 09/14/10

CONTRACT B -30454-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0301074 DBE GOAL: 0.00 DESCRIPTION: SMALL STRUCTURE REPLACEMENT ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 593,000.00

CALL: 351 ROUTE: US 421 LAPORTE DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON US 421 OVER EAST BRANCH OF SLOCUM DITCH, 1.18 MILES NORTH

COUNTY: LAPORTE

CODE	COUNTY: LAPORTE BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE		AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
26-3919039	TONN AND BLANK CONSTRUCTION LL	MICHIGAN CITY Indiana	219-879-7321	\$ 	692,637.57	R 		
32-0154474	JCI BRIDGE GROUP INC	LAPORTE Indiana	219-324-9393	\$ 	562,953.88	R 		
35-0918397	RIETH RILEY CONSTRUCTION	GOSHEN Indiana	574-875-5183	\$ 	782,779.12	R 	 	
35-1035122	GARIUP CONSTRUCTION CO INC	GARY Indiana	219-887-5233	\$ 	593,700.00	R 	 	
35-1058916	WOODRUFF & SONS INC	MICHIGAN CITY Indiana	219-872-8605	\$ 	755,626.95	R 	 	
35-1569222	GRIMMER CONSTRUCTION INC	HIGHLAND Indiana	219-924-1623	\$ 	566,608.44	R 	 	
35-1817530	PIONEER ASSOCIATES INC	LEO Indiana	260-627-5981	\$ 	726,305.45	R 	 	
38-3806996	HIS CONSTRUCTORS INC	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-284-1195	\$	555,838.00	R 	X 	AWARD PENDING *

^{*}ADDITIONAL TIME IS REQUIRED FOR BID REVIEW BY DISTRICT OR LPA.

PAGE: 16 DATE: 09/14/10

CONTRACT B -31374-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0101526 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE DECK REPLACEMENT ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 1,680,000.00

CALL: 361 ROUTE: 120 FT. WAYNE DISTRICT LOCATION: ON SR 120 OVER I-69, 0.07 MILE EAST OF SR 127

COUNTY: STEUBEN

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE		AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
32-0154474	JCI BRIDGE GROUP INC 	LAPORTE Indiana	219-324-9393	\$ 	1,149,933.38	R 	X 	AWARD DBE 4.79%
35-1057237	R L MCCOY INC	COLUMBIA CITY Indiana	260-625-3443	\$ 	1,257,442.59	R 		
35-1374866	PRIMCO INC 	FORT WAYNE Indiana	260-478-1548	\$ 	1,164,195.10	R 		
38-1456833	C A HULL COMPANY INC	WALLED LAKE Michigan	248-363-3813	\$ 	1,492,585.55	R 		
38-2675420	ANLAAN CORPORATION	SPRING LAKE Michigan	616-846-8442	\$ 	1,434,680.62	R	 	

PAGE: 17 DATE: 09/14/10

CONTRACT B -31728-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0810069
DESCRIPTION: SCOUR PROTECTION
DESCRIPTION: SCOUR PROTECTION
DESCRIPTION: \$ 506,000.00

CALL: 381 ROUTE: SEYMOUR DISTRICT LOCATION: AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS WITHIN THE SEYMOUR DISTRICT

COUNTY: VARIOUS

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	A	MOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1310611	DUNCAN ROBERTSON INC	FRANKLIN Indiana	317-736-6024	\$ 	627,521.00	R 		
35-1618530	AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE	JEFFERSONVILLE Indiana	812-280-4404	\$ 	688,998.94	R 		
35-1636776	LINKEL COMPANY 	BATESVILLE Indiana	812-934-5190	\$ 	429,218.00	R 		
35-1817574	YARDBERRY LANDSCAPE	ANDERSON Indiana	765-378-5783	\$ 	641,105.00	R 		
35-2040801	GOHMANN ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION 	CLARKSVILLE Indiana	812-282-1349	\$ 	366,900.00	R 	X	AWARD
35-2155873	KINGS TRUCKING & EXCAVATION IN	SEYMOUR Indiana	812-522-6973	\$ 	377,774.33	R 		

INDIANA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION OFFICIAL TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED

PAGE: 18

DBE GOAL: 3.00

DATE: 09/14/10 FOR THE LETTING OF September 01, 2010

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 1,314,000.00 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE REHABILITATION OR REPAIR CALL: 391 ROUTE: GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON CR 725W OVER CONNS CREEK

FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0500096

COUNTY: RUSH

CONTRACT B -32317-A

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE		AMOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1128289	BEATY CONSTRUCTION INC	BOGGSTOWN Indiana	317-835-2254	\$ 	1,030,324.22	R 		
35-1310611	DUNCAN ROBERTSON INC	FRANKLIN Indiana	317-736-6024	\$ 	1,051,579.40	R 		
35-1357381	DAVE OMARA CONTRACTOR INC	NORTH VERNON Indiana	812-346-4135	\$ 	1,023,472.10	R 		
35-1385672	FORCE CONSTRUCTION CO INC	COLUMBUS Indiana	812-372-8441	\$ 	1,144,449.69	R 		
35-1618530	AMERICAN CONTRACTING & SERVICE	JEFFERSONVILLE Indiana	812-280-4404	\$ 	1,298,836.94	R 		
35-1673827	H E HENDERSON INC	MARTINSVILLE Indiana	765-342-2662	\$ 	946,821.23	R 	X	AWARD DBE 5.94%
35-1917625	MILESTONE CONTRACTORS LP	COLUMBUS Indiana	800-854-1830	\$ 	1,021,800.00	R 	 	
38-3806996	HIS CONSTRUCTORS INC	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-284-1195	\$ 	1,124,489.04	R 	 	

PAGE: 19

DATE: 09/14/10

CONTRACT B -33233-B FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 1005447 DBE GOAL: 0.00 DESCRIPTION: BRIDGE MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 155,000.00

CALL: 395 ROUTE: I-70 GREENFIELD DISTRICT

LOCATION: ON I-70, 3.25 MILES WEST OF I-465, EASTBOUND RAMP FROM TERMINAL TO EASTBOUND I-70

COUNTY: MARION

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AI	MOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1389596	CARDINAL INDIANA INC 	BLOOMINGTON Indiana	812-335-1084	\$	379,700.00	R 	X 	AWARD *
35-1841857	CRI CONSTRUCTION INC	LARWILL Indiana	260-327-3300	\$	673,534.00	R 		

^{*}AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN \$1,000,000.00.

PAGE: 20 DATE: 09/14/10

CONTRACT B -33394-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0810384 DESCRIPTION: ENVIRONMENTAL MITIGATION ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 89,700.00

CALL: 401 ROUTE: 66 VINCENNES DISTRICT LOCATION: ALONG SR 66 OVER BIG CREEK OVERFLOW, 2.31 MILES EAST OF

SR 165 COUNTY: POSEY

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AI	MOUNT OF BID	TYPE	LOW	REMARKS
35-1009310	DEIG BROTHERS LUMBER & CONSTR	EVANSVILLE Indiana	812-423-4201	\$ 	94,154.77	R	X	AWARD *
35-1636776	LINKEL COMPANY	BATESVILLE Indiana	812-934-5190	\$ 	259,671.00	R		
35-1844393	J F NEW & ASSOCIATES INC	WALKERTON Indiana	574-586-3400	\$ 	177,903.11	R		
35-2040801	GOHMANN ASPHALT & CONSTRUCTION	CLARKSVILLE Indiana	812-282-1349	\$ 	96,900.00	R		

^{*}AWARDED PURSUANT TO IC 8-23-9-4(1)(A) - LOW BIDDER IS LESS THAN \$1,000,000.00.

PAGE: 21 DATE: 09/14/10

CONTRACT T -32129-A FED/STATE PROJECT NO. 0900622 DBE GOAL: 4.00 DESCRIPTION: TRAFFIC SIGNAL MODERNIZATION ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$ 4,275,000.00 ROUTE: VARIOUS VINCENNES DISTRICT

CALL: 421

LOCATION: AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS THROUGHOUT DOWNTOWN EVANSVILLE

COUNTY:	VANDERBURGH

CODE	BIDDER	ADDRESS	PHONE	AMOUNT OF BID	TYP	E LOW	REMARKS
06-1675328	MARTELL ELECTRIC LLC	SOUTH BEND Indiana	574-271-5000	\$ 2,839,292.92	R 	X	AWARD DBE 4.70%
35-0392360	HOOSIER COMPANY INC 	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-872-8125	\$ 2,907,758.06	R 		
35-0821499	JAMES H DREW CORPORATION	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-876-3739	\$ 3,383,820.04	R 		
35-1262778	MIDWESTERN ELECTRIC INC	INDIANAPOLIS Indiana	317-545-7641	\$ 2,949,568.77	R 		
35-1657131	MICHIANA CONTRACTING INC	PLYMOUTH Indiana	574-936-8613	\$ 2,899,943.92	R 		
35-1675187	HUMMEL ELECTRIC INC	EVANSVILLE Indiana	812-474-1500	\$ 3,220,632.10	R 		
74-2851603	QUANTA SERVICES INC 	SOUTH BEND Indiana	574-272-9673	\$ 3,715,076.34	R		